TR TFHR-THoTAlo / Tedo
S&clo / UloUlo—91 /2014—16
A T URE (T HEAA T

HFRT TAE, FTT q9T

SR HE9li @K 2T Tt

STHTEIT
femh uRfire

-3, Yvs (P)
(SR U<¥ e Aved & faea)
dETS, JEWiadr, 8 fauwEy, 2022

ATVl 17, 1944 [d HHd

HH-FT—242

faem= T afeuare

= 1919 / fq0%0 / FI<T / 159(%)/2022
AGTS, 6 faawR, 2022

SIBRCEl
garof

IR TSI & YT A T damad (Seies) fagd, 2022 ST SR USw faumE /M @
i 6 fawwaR, 2022 @ JUARH H RIAMUT BT T, SR U< g |91 &1 ufsear den
BRI—aTe fHTaet, 1958 @ 99 126 & Ir=Fd TAggRT UHTRIG fvar Sirar 2 |

SR U &F Uargd al Tl damad (FeeE) fagad, 2022

IR U & Targd ol ST derad S, 1961 &1 IR AR
B b foru

IGERED

YRT TR & fogaxd af § fR=falaa sifrferas s+mar smar 8-

1—(1) T8 IR SR UeY &= dYargd don Rier dard (HeieE)  wfe T ek
SRR, 2022 FET SIRAT | R

(2) IB AP 4 IR, 2022 W UIT GAT FHS IR |




2 IR TSI SRATEIRT i, 8 I?%‘I*GN, 2022

SRR 2—I@R UST &F d=rgd den i derad siffRM, 1961 (1 e e
s S iR @l T R) @Y aRT 15 H—

33 T 1961 Pl (@) SUIRT (1) & o MW | AWFH’ & WH W TG YA
EIRT 15 T AR <@ A i,

e @) SUERT (13) ® &g U 99 & WM W T ]I gY@ foA

SR |
ERT 28 T 39 M @ gt 28 H—
e (@) ST (1) ¥ W o ¥ e B WM W TR AR

- g Ry SR,
(@) SUURT (13) # ¥eg “UF a9 & WM W < ‘I 9§ 3G A

STRIT |
o aiR 4—(1) SR YSI &F vErgd dor Rren vamd (Fene) ﬁ’\”ﬁ'ﬂ
angfi IS, 2022 TaggRT FRRYT fvar Sirar 2 AT AT 8

NI 2022
(2) WO FRET & 81 gU 1 SwaRT (1) H§ Mfdse srare
ERT AT G ot AR & Iuaeei & 3= & dls B
I P T B PG, $H AWTH GRT JAT T A
Jefem & W gell Sudl & | @ A1 @l W s
SRR A g9 I & Suery W 9RaE |99l | g o |

SECEP I INY

SR U T H &F gargdl qm T varadi 1 RMuEr R P Sqa W SR uay
&F gargd dl e dargd SiftifRm, 1961 (SR U I W 33 W 1961) SrfafAa
fpar T § 1 Saa AT B aRT 15 SR 28 H HEI: &F ARG yg™ 7l Rl dAd Jege @
gfer 31fIear URaTa &7 Sool © | S GRRH & SWIRT (1) § I8 Iudy ® & afe sifdvay uxama
JorRefay & demd a1 e dad & Mt 9ewi & | 9= @ o ¥ e wewli &
TR W AR ST © A1 IR W A7 3fedel 59 WU H US URT B A UfARA B SR | I
IR B SUIRT (13) ¥ I8 ey 2 & ifdea wa@ o1 @5 Ay, gaRefa f& uga a1
awamuamﬁﬁaﬁ$waéfﬁﬂﬂmwﬁaﬁm|sﬁmm$waﬁm
T Rrerr vErEl H Aad e @ Reafd g+ 81| e demgdl a7 derdl & e ®f

PR B gfte | I8 fafreay fbar w6 Saa At @1 denfea exe a8 Iudy fhar
S 6 aRefa aRT 15 & Rl B0 v & v a1 arT 28 & o9 bl oreuer & fawg
JfIear GG B Bls AlfCH, HA: [FA U@ I 38 R Ug T80T B S & &I 991 & iR
Tl el BT SIRA SR & ey A1 OTar Ui Jfedel 99 O AT UG gRYT B W UfaRa
T8 B W9 d% b sifdvar e, Faifa dewl @ @a W & A a1 fUEE 9wl @
FqHAT A T AT S |

Jfd I5g fdure wvsa w3 | 981 o &Rk yaled fafveeg &1 fharfad & & fou qra
femt SRiArE & S awad ofl, S IIUTd R RIS 4 IaCER, 2022 B IR U &
UgTd dem Tl damad (W) SRATey, 2022 (SR U AT 6T 8 ¥ 2022) U fhar
T

g fage qatad sraree o ufawenfid oxd & forg qrvenfia fdar S = |

IrfY snfeca=rer
qe& 74 |

1014 RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e



IR TSI STATEIRYT oic, 8 IE‘H*GN, 2022 3

SR U & Uarad T e darad (SeieE) {99, 2022 gRT AR @ S el g
IfRfTE B AT gRIBH BT SN |

SR U< & Yarad dr e garad e, 1961

&TRT 15 (11) TR &3 UaId & doblel Maifd 9wl & @ 6 & e 4 31fdw

AT & Uk &,

XXX XXX XXX
(13) ifdeary W@ BT PIS AMCH U@ P UG U8 BRH & U dy & W T80T
& far SIRATT |

&RT 28 (1) UTd fTelT U=md & deaplele Faifed ewl B Bol G & TR 4 3ffed

THee W TiRd @,

XXX XXX XXX
(13) faears &1 I ACH AT & U T B & b a9 & W T A8
o SR |

3T 9,
&Iy AR T,

Rl

TR AT |

UTTAR PRADESH SARKAR
SANSADIYA KARYA ANUBHAG-1

No. 596/XC-S-1-22-26S-2022
Dated Lucknow, December 8, 2022

NOTIFICATION
MISCELLANEOUS

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of "Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayat
Tatha Zila Panchayat (Sansodhan) Vidheyak, 2022" introduced in the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly
on December 6, 2022.

THE UTTAR PRADESH KSHETTRA PANCHAYATS AND ZILA PANCHAYATS
(SANSHODHAN) VIDHEY AK, 2022
A
BILL

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and  Zila

Panchayats Adhiniyam, 1961.
IT Is HEREBY enacted in the Seventy-third Year of the Republic of India as

follows —

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Short title
Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2022. and

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from October 4, 2022. commencement

1014 RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e



4 IR TSI SRATEIRT i, 8 I?%‘I*GN, 2022

Amendment of 2. In section 15 of the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats
section 15 of Adhiniyam, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),-
U.P. Act no. 33
of 1961 (a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words
"not less than two-third" shall be substituted;
(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words
"two years" shall be substituted.
Amendment of 3. In section 28 of the principal Act,-
section 28 . .
(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words
"not less than two-third" shall be substituted;
(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words
"two years" shall be substituted.
Repeal and 4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila U.P. Ordinance
saving Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022 is hereby repealed. no. 8 of 2022

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act
as amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at

all material times.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats Adhiniyam, 1961 (U.P. Act no. 33 of
1961) has been enacted to provide for the establishment of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats in the
State of Uttar Pradesh. Sections 15 and 28 of the said Act, deals with the motion of no-confidence in
Pramukh of Kshettra Panchayats and Adhyakshya of Zila Panchayats respectively. Sub-section (11) of the
said section provides that if the motion of no-confidence is carried with the support of more than half of
the total numbers of elected members of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats, as the case may be,
then the Pramukh or Adhyakshya, as the case may be, shall cease to hold office as such. Sub-section (13)
of the said sections provides that no notice of motion of no-confidence shall be received within one year
of assumption of office by the Pramukh or the Adhyaksha, as the case may be. Due to these provisions
there was always a situation of instability in the Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats . With a view to
ensure stability of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats it was decided to amend the said Act to
Provide that no notice of motion of no-confidence against a Pramukh under section 15 or against an
Adhyaksha under section 28, as the case may be, shall be received within two years of the assumption of
office by a Pramukh or an Adhyaksha respectively and the Pramukh of Kshettra Panchayats or Adhyaksha
of Zila Panchayats shall not cease to hold office unless no-confidence motion is carried with the support

of not less than two-thirds of the total number of elected members thereof.

1014 RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e



IR TSI STATEIRYT oic, 8 IE‘H*GN, 2022 5

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 (Uttar Pradesh Ordinance no. 8 of 2022) was promulgated by the Governor
on October 4, 2022.

This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance.

YOGI ADITYANATH
Mukhya Mantri.

By order,

J. P. SINGH-II,
Pramukh Sachiv.

GoTHYOUI0—T0UT0 1014 TTIF—2022—(1642)—599+5+25=629 U (FIER /€10 / JATHIT) |

1014 RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e



