
 

Øe-la[;k&242 jftLVªs'ku uEcj&,lå,låihå@,yå 
 MCywå@,uåihå&91@2014&16 

 ykblsUl Vw iksLV ,sV dUls'kuy jsV 

 

—

¼mŸkj çns'k fo/kku e.My ds fo/ks;d½ 

 

mRrj izns'k 

&&&&&&& 
la[;k  1919@fo0l0@lalnh;@159¼laa ½/2022 

y[kuÅ] 6 fnlEcj] 2022 
 

vf/klwpuk 

mRrj çns”k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la”kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2022 tks mRrj izns'k fo/kku lHkk ds 
fnukad 6 fnlEcj] 2022 ds mios'ku esa iqj%LFkkfir fd;k x;k] mRrj izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k rFkk 
dk;Z&lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1958 ds fu;e 126 ds vUrxZr ,rn~}kjk izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 

mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2022 
mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 dk vxzrj la'kks/ku 

djus ds fy, 

fo/ks;d 
Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frgRrjosa o"kZ esa fuEufyf[kr vf/kfu;e cuk;k tkrk gS%& 

 

1&¼1½ ;g vf/kfu;e mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ 
vf/kfu;e] 2022 dgk tk;sxkA 

¼2½ ;g fnukad 4 vDVwcj] 2022 ls çòRr gqvk le>k tk;sxkA 

laf{kIr uke vkSj 
çkjEHk 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2                                                   mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 8 fnlEcj] 2022 

1014  RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e 

 

mRrj izns'k 
vf/kfu;e la[;k 
33 lu~ 1961 dh  
/kkjk 15 dk 
la'kks/ku 

2&mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼ftls vkxs ^^ewy 
vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 15 esa]&  

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼11½ esa 'kCn ^^vk/ks ls vf/kd^^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^vU;wu  
nks-frgkbẐ ^ j[k fn;s tk;saxs( 

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼13½ esa 'kCn ^^,d o"kẐ ^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^nks o"kẐ ^ j[k fn;s 
tk;saxsA 

/kkjk 28 dk 
la'kks/ku 

3&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 28 esa]& 
¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼11½ esa 'kCn ^^vk/ks ls vf/kd^^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^vU;wu  

nks-frgkbẐ ^ j[k fn;s tk;saxs( 
¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼13½ esa 'kCn ^^,d o"kẐ ^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^nks o"kẐ ^ j[k fn;s 

tk;saxsA 
fujlu vkSj 
O;kòfRr 

4&¼1½ mRrj izns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ 
v/;kns'k] 2022 ,rn~}kjk fujflr fd;k tkrk gSA 

mRrj izns'k 
v/;kns'k la[;k 8 
lu~ 2022 

 ¼2½ ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa fufnZ"V v/;kns'k 
}kjk ;Fkk la'kksf/kr ewy vf/kfu;e ds micU/kksa ds v/khu dr̀ dksbZ dk;Z 
;k dh x;h dksbZ dk;Zokgh] bl vf/kfu;e }kjk ;Fkk la'kksf/kr ewy 
vf/kfu;e ds lg izR;FkhZ micU/kksa ds v/khu dr̀ ;k dh x;h le>h 
tk;sxh ekuksa bl vf/kfu;e ds micU/k lHkh lkjoku le;ksa esa izoR̀r FksA 

 

 

&&&&&& 

mn~ns'; vkSj dkj.k 

mRrj izns'k jkT; esa {ks= iapk;rksa rFkk ftyk iapk;rksa dh LFkkiuk djus ds mn~ns'; ls mRrj izns'k 
{ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼mRrj izns'k vf/kfu;e la[;k 33 lu~ 1961½ vf/kfu;fer 
fd;k x;k gSA mDr vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 15 vkSj 28 esa Øe'k% {ks= iapk;r izeq[k rFkk ftyk iapk;r v/;{k ds 
izfr vfo'okl izLrko dk mYys[k gSA mDr /kkjkvksa dh mi/kkjk ¼11½ esa ;g mica/k gS fd ;fn vfo'okl izLrko 
;FkkfLFkfr {ks= iapk;r ;k ftyk iapk;r ds fuokZfpr lnL;ksa dh dqy la[;k ds vk/ks ls vf/kd lnL;ksa ds 
leFkZu ls yk;k tkrk gS rks ;FkkfLFkfr izeq[k ;k v/;{k bl :i esa in /kkj.k djus ls izfojr gks tk;saxsA mDr 
/kkjkvksa dh mi/kkjk ¼13½ esa ;g mica/k gS fd vfo'okl izLrko dh dksbZ uksfVl] ;FkkfLFkfr fdlh izeq[k ;k 
v/;{k }kjk in xzg.k fd;s tkus ds ,d o"kZ ds Hkhrj izkIr ugha dh tk;sxhA bu mica/kksa ds dkj.k {ks= iapk;rksa 
rFkk ftyk iapk;rksa esa lnSo vLFkkf;Ro dh fLFkfr cuh jghA {ks= iapk;rksa rFkk ftyk iapk;rksa ds LFkkf;Ro dks 
lqfuf'pr djus dh n`f"V ls ;g fofu'p; fd;k x;k fd mDr vf/kfu;e dks la'kksf/kr djds ;g mica/k fd;k 
tk; fd ;FkkfLFkfr /kkjk 15 ds v/khu fdlh izeq[k ds fo:) ;k /kkjk 28 ds v/khu fdlh v/;{k ds fo:) 
vfo'okl izLrko dh dksbZ uksfVl] Øe'k% fdlh izeq[k ;k v/;{k }kjk in xzg.k fd;s tkus ds nks o"kksZa ds Hkhrj 
izkIr ugha dh tk;sxh vkSj {ks= iapk;r izeq[k ;k ftyk iapk;r v/;{k rc rd viuk in /kkj.k djus ls izfojr 
ugha gksaxs tc rd fd vfo'okl izLrko] fuokZfpr lnL;ksa dh dqy la[;k ds vU;wu nks frgkbZ lnL;ksa ds 
leFkZu ls u yk;k tk;A  

pw¡fd jkT; fo/kku e.My l= esa ugha Fkk vkSj iwoksZDr fofu'p; dks fØ;kfUor djus ds fy, rqjUr 
fo/kk;h dk;Zokgh dh tkuh vko';d Fkh] vr% jkT;iky }kjk fnukad 4 vDVwcj] 2022 dks mRrj izns'k {ks= 
iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2022 ¼mRrj izns'k v/;kns'k la[;k 8 lu~ 2022½ iz[;kfir fd;k 
x;kA 

;g fo/ks;d iwoksZDr v/;kns'k dks izfrLFkkfir djus ds fy, iqj%LFkkfir fd;k tkrk gSA 

 

;ksxh vkfnR;ukFk 

eq[; ea=hA 



 mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 8 fnlEcj] 2022 3 

1014  RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e 

 

mRrj izns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2022 }kjk la'kksf/kr dh tkus okyh ewy 
vf/kfu;e dh laxr /kkjkvksa dk m)j.kA 

mRrj izns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 

/kkjk 15 ¼11½ izLrko {ks= iapk;r ds rRdkyhu fuokZfpr lnL;ksa dh dqy la[;k ds vk/ks ls vf/kd 
leFkZu ls ikfjr gks] 

                 XXX                                            XXX                                        XXX 

 ¼13½ vfo”okl izLrko dk dksbZ uksfVl izeq[k ds in xzg.k djus ds ,d o"kZ ds Hkhrj xzg.k 
ugh fd;k tk;sxkA 

/kkjk 28 ¼11½ izLrko ftyk iapk;r ds rRdkyhu fuokZfpr lnL;ksa dh dqy la[;k ds vk/ks ls vf/kd 
leFkZu ls ikfjr gks] 

                 XXX                                            XXX                                        XXX 

 ¼13½ vfo”okl dk dksbZ uksfVl v/;{k ds in xzg.k djus ds ,d o"kZ ds Hkhrj xzg.k ugh 
fd;k tk;sxkA 

———— 

 vkKk ls] 
 iznhi dqekj nqcs] 
 izeq[k lfpoA 

———— 
 
 

UTTAR PRADESH SARKAR 
SANSADIYA KARYA ANUBHAG-1 

——— 
No. 596/XC-S-1–22-26S-2022 

 Dated Lucknow, December 8, 2022 
——— 

NOTIFICATION 
MISCELLANEOUS                                                                                                                             

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution,  the Governor is 

pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of "Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayat 

Tatha Zila Panchayat (Sansodhan) Vidheyak, 2022" introduced in the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly 

on December 6, 2022. 

 
THE UTTAR PRADESH KSHETTRA PANCHAYATS AND ZILA PANCHAYATS 

(SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2022 
A 

BILL 
 further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and  Zila 

Panchayats Adhiniyam, 1961. 
IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Seventy-third Year of the Republic of India as 

follows :– 
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila 

Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2022. 
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from October 4, 2022.

 

Short title  
and 
commencement 

 



4                                                   mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 8 fnlEcj] 2022 

1014  RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e 

 

Amendment of  

section 15 of  

U.P. Act no. 33  

of 1961 

2. In section 15 of the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats 

Adhiniyam, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),- 

(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words  

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words  

"two years" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of  

section 28 
3. In section 28 of  the principal Act,- 

(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words  

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words  

"two years" shall be substituted. 

Repeal and 

saving 
4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila 

Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022 is hereby repealed. 

U.P. Ordinance 

no. 8 of 2022 

 (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action 

taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the 

Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been 

done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act 

as amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at 

all material times. 

 

 
 

–——— 
 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

The Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats Adhiniyam, 1961 (U.P. Act no. 33 of 

1961) has been enacted to provide for the establishment of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats in the 

State of Uttar Pradesh. Sections 15 and 28 of the said Act, deals with the motion of no-confidence in 

Pramukh of Kshettra Panchayats and Adhyakshya of Zila Panchayats respectively. Sub-section (11) of the 

said section provides that if the motion of no-confidence is carried with the support of more than half of 

the total numbers of elected members of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats, as the case may be, 

then the Pramukh or Adhyakshya, as the case may be, shall cease to hold office as such. Sub-section (13) 

of the said sections provides that no notice of motion of no-confidence shall be received within one year 

of assumption of office by the Pramukh or the Adhyaksha, as the case may be. Due to these provisions 

there was always a situation of instability in the Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats . With a view to 

ensure stability of Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats it was decided to amend the said Act to 

Provide that no notice of motion of no-confidence against a Pramukh under section 15 or against an 

Adhyaksha under section 28, as the case may be, shall be received within two years of the assumption of 

office by a Pramukh or an Adhyaksha respectively and the Pramukh of Kshettra Panchayats or Adhyaksha 

of Zila Panchayats shall not cease to hold office unless no-confidence motion is carried with the support 

of not less than two-thirds of the total number of elected members thereof. 

 



 mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 8 fnlEcj] 2022 5 

1014  RPH (Panchayat) (Sansadiya) 2022 Data 7e 

 

 Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to 

implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats  

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 (Uttar Pradesh Ordinance no. 8 of 2022) was promulgated by the Governor 

on October  4, 2022. 

This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance. 

 

 

YOGI ADITYANATH 

           Mukhya Mantri. 

 
––––––– 

 
 

 By order, 

 J. P.  SINGH-II, 
 Pramukh Sachiv. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ih0,l0;w0ih0&,0ih0 1014 jkti=&2022&¼1642½&599$5$25=629 izfr;ka ¼dEI;wVj@Vh0@vkWQlsV½A 


